Buyer: Buffy Meyer

6390 OF

NebraskalLand Calendar

Opening Date: 11/10/2020

RR Donnelley & Sons

E Description Aradius Group (Omaha Print)} Interstate Printing Company Company

B Description Quantity Break |UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

5 CALENDQECF;FE(EEB%TAISEN;Z PAGE 2501-5000 M |3 2,190.00] $ 3,673.60 5,739.20
3 CALENDQECF;FE(EEB%TAISEN;Z PAGE 5001-7500 M |3 1,677.00] $ 2,807.27 4,003.80
4 | e veieppaer | 7.501-10000] M |3 1515.00f $ 244032 341013
5 | e oveLeD paER | 10,001-12,500] M | 1.423.001 $ 228062 311740
5 CALENDIQERCPYF\)C(I)_EB%RSENR?,Z PAGE 12.501-15,000 M |® 1,369.00] $ 2,205.55 2,953.36
2 CALENDQECPYF\)C(I)_EB%RSENR?,Z PAGE 15.001-17,500| M |'® 1,329.00] $ 2,126.46 2,837.33
3 CALENDQECPYF\)C(I)_EB%RSENR?,Z PAGE 17.501-20,000] M | 1,308.00] $ 2,036.00 2,760.57
11 CALENDQECI?(FE?EB%TAISENRM PAGE 2501-5000 M |8 2,515.00] $ 4,110.89 6,235.60
14| S v CieD PAPER | 10,001-12,500] M |8 1.962.00) $ 2480.96 331790
15 CALENDQECPYRC(EEB%TAISIE\IRM PAGE 12.501-15.000] M |8 1,496.00] $ 2,400.80 3,129.68
16 CALENDQECPYRC(EEB%TAISIE\IRM PAGE 15.001-17500| M |8 1,451.00] $ 2,355.31 2,998.67
17| A veLep paper | 17,501 20,000 M |8 1429.00) $ 223153 291234
1| CALENDAR PRODUCTION 34 PAGE v ls 693.001 s 2.180.55

RECYCLED PAPER

Additional M's
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Buyer: Buffy Meyer

6390 OF

NebraskalLand Calendar

Opening Date: 11/10/2020

RR Donnelley & Sons

E Description Aradius Group (Omaha Print)} Interstate Printing Company Company

B Description Quantity Break |UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

19 CALENDQECF;FE(EEB%TAISENR% PAGE 1.000-2500| M |'® 4,214.00] $ 7,048.79 11,705.00
20 CALENDQECF;FE;(EEB(;TAISENR% PAGE 2501-5000 M |8 2,461.00] $ 4,108.79 6,326.00
21 CALENDQECF;FE(EEB%TAISENR% PAGE 5001-7500 M |3 1,855.00] $ 3,098.69 4,387.80
22| A oD paper | 7,501-10,000] M |8 1e57.000 3 269949 512790
23 CALENDQECPYFE:?EB%TAISENR% PAGE 10001-12500] M | 1,554.00] $ 2,504.97 3,401.30
25 CALENDQECPYFE:?EB%TAISENR% PAGE 15.001-17,500| M |'® 1,452.00] $ 2,372.49 3,085.53
26 CALENDQECPYFE:?EB%TAISENR% PAGE 17.501- 20,000 M |'® 1,429.00] $ 2,247.97 2,998.86
o8 CALENDAI?/IPRF\(;(I)I\IIDlFi(AZ;IIECI)QN 32 PAGE 1,000 - 2,500 m s 3,768.00 NO BID 10,368.00
29 CALENDAI?/IPRI:\(;(I)NIIDlFJ)'(A:;IIECI)QN 32 PAGE 2501-5000] M |8 2.190.00 NO BID 5,632.80
20 CALENDAI?/IPRI:\(;(I)NIIDlFJ)'(A:;IIECI)QN 32 PAGE s001-7.500] M |8 1.677.00 NO BID 3,910.60
31 CALENDAF\Q/:;F;(IJI\IIDECA:;L%N 32 PAGE 2 501-10000] M |8 1,515.00 NO BID 3,321.07
32 CALENDAIT”;%(IJI\EI)EE;L%N 32 PAGE 10,001-12.500| M |8 1,423.00 NO BID 3,030.90
33 CALENDAI?/II;%(I)I\IIDEE;IIEORN 32 PAGE 12,501 - 15,000 m s 1,369.00 NO BID 2,868.80
24 CALENDAIT”;%(IJI\EI)EE;L%N 32 PAGE 15.001-17.500| M |8 1,329.00 NO BID 2,753.60
as CALENDAI?/ |Eez?|\?g§;:£%'\l 32 PAGE 17501-20000] M |® 1,308.00 NO BID 2.677.54
35| CALENDAR PRODUCTION 32 PAGE v s 634.00 NO BID

VIRGIN PAPER

Additional M's
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Buyer: Buffy Meyer

6390 OF
NebraskalLand Calendar

Opening Date: 11/10/2020

T]'j Description Aradius Group (Omaha Print)} Interstate Printing Company RR Donnelley & Sons

o Company

B Description Quantity Break |UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

37 CALENDAI?/|F|;F\(;(|)[\||33,(A\:;|IEC|)QN 34 PAGE 1,000 - 2,500 M s 4.430.00 NO BID 11,443.00
38 CALENDAI?/|F|;F\(;(|)[\||33,(A\:;|IEC|)QN 34 PAGE 2,501 - 5,000 M s 2.515.00 NO BID 6,123.60
39 CALENDAF\Q/IFF’{Z?’\%E;‘E%N 34 PAGE 5001-7500 M |8 1,881.00 NO BID 4,214.40
40 CALENDAI?/|F|;F\(;(|)[\||33,(A\:;|IEC|)QN 34 PAGE 7501 - 10,000 M s 1,672.00 NO BID 3,550.80
a1 CALENDAI?/IPRRG(I)l\llleJ)'CA:;IIE%N 34 PAGE 10,001 - 12,500 M s 1,562.00 NO BID 3,226.80
42 CALENDAI?/IPRRG(I)l\llleJ)'CA:;IIE%N 34 PAGE 12,501 - 15,000 M s 1,496.00 NO BID 3,040.00
43 CALENDAI?/IPRRG(I)l\llleJ)'CA:;IIE%N 34 PAGE 15,001 - 17,500 M s 1,451.00 NO BID 2,911.60
44 CALENDAI?/IPRRG(I)l\llleJ)'CA:;IIE%N 34 PAGE 17,501 - 20,000 M s 1,429.00 NO BID 2,825.14
45 CALENDAI?/FRZ?A?[F{E;:;?QN 34 PAGE Additional M's| M | $ 693.00 NO BID

46 CALENDAI?/:DRZ?A?[F{E;IE%N 36 PAGE 1,000 - 2,500 M ls 4,214.00 NO BID 11,538.00
47 CALENDAI?/:DRZ?A?[F{E;IE%N 36 PAGE 2,501 - 5,000 M ls 2.461.00 NO BID 6,208.80
48 CALENDAI?/:DRZ?A?[F{E;IE%N 36 PAGE 5,001 - 7,500 M ls 1,855.00 NO BID 4,281.40
49 CALENDAITAI;%?A?[F{E;:;%N 36 PAGE 7501 - 10,000 M ls 1,657.00 NO BID 3,628.40
50 CALENDAT/E%?\?;&;:;ORN 36 PAGE 10,001 - 12,500 M s 1,554.00 NO BID 3,303.50
51 CALENDAT/E%?\?;&;:;ORN 36 PAGE 12,501 - 15,000 M s 1,491.00 NO BID 3,119.92
52 CALENDAT/E%?\?;&;:;ORN 36 PAGE 15,001 - 17,500 M s 1,452.00 NO BID 2,990.60
53 CALENDAI?/IPRRé(I)l\IIDlFJ)E;IIE%N 36 PAGE 17,501 - 20,000 M s 1,429.00 NO BID 2,905.83
54 CALENDAI?/IPRIZ(I)l\Ii)gE;IIEORN 36 PAGE Additional M's| M | $ 717.00 NO BID
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Buyer: Buffy Meyer

6390 OF
NebraskalLand Calendar

Opening Date: 11/10/2020

Tita Description Aradius Group (Omaha Print) | Interstate Printing Company RR Donnelley & Sons
£ Company
-

Description |  Quantity Break [UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Payment Terms NET 30 030
Delivery Days ARO 15 3
Comments

Invalid Bid

PrintCo - No Invitation to Bid Form

Bid Withdrawn
Colonial Press
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